
MAILER:

Sandy Spring Bank

OBJECTIVE:
 
Sandy Spring Bank faced the challenge of promoting their 
premier money market savings accounts and increasing 
enrollments.  

SOLUTION:

eTargetMedia planned and executed a targeted email 
marketing campaign that reached financially savvy 
individuals and families who regularly research banking 
products to locate the best interest rates and investment 
products that will help them reach their financial goals. 
The email campaign was geo-targeted within a specified 
radius around Sandy Spring Bank locations. The creative 
was designed to promote Sandy Spring Bank’s premier 
money market savings accounts and featured the special 
1.7% guaranteed interest rate for the first 6 months as 
well as the benefits of the account which included the 
safety and security of FDIC Insurance, funds available 
when needed, online and mobile banking access and free 
checks. A strong call to action helped to drive interest in 
the campaign.    
  
OUTCOME:

The Sandy Spring Bank email campaign was a very 
successful acquisition campaign and helped to increase 
enrollments in the money market accounts as well as 
helped to drive leads and interest in Sandy Spring Bank’s 
services. The campaign also generated a high open rate 
and a high click through rate.
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